

**BID TABULATION
FOR THE CONSTRUCTION OF THE FULTON ROAD MEMBRANE FILTRATION FACILITY
BID NO. 14-0527 - FLOYD COUNTY, GEORGIA**

Bid Opening Time: 2:00 PM Date: June 5, 2014 Place: Floyd County Administration Building Rome, GA		Bidder: Bid Bond:	Layne Heavy Civil, Inc. 300 East Broad Street Fairburn, GA 30213 Travelers Casualty and Surety Co. of America Hartford, CT	Heavy Constructors, Inc. 1596 Lower Roswell Marietta, GA 30068 Fidelity and Deposit Co. of Maryland Schaumburg, IL	Ruby-Collins, Inc. 4806 Wright Drive Smyrna, GA 30082 The Hanover Insurance Co. Worcester, MA	\$2,286,000.00 \$2,507,000.00 \$2,980,000.00
--	--	----------------------	--	--	---	--

BASE BID - LUMP SUM

MAJOR EQUIPMENT ITEMS

Spec Section	Equipment	Manufacturer/Supplier	Price	Price	Price
Appendix A	Membrane Equipment and Appurtenances	a. GE Water & Process Technologies/ Templeton & Associates	\$738,157.50	\$738,157.50	\$738,157.50
33 3217	Raw Water Submersible Vertical Turbine Pump (One Pump)	a Layne a Peerless a Goulds	9,000.00	19,000.00	20,000.00
42 2113.16	High Service Vertical Turbine Pumps (Two Pumps)	a Layne a Peerless a Goulds	48,000.00	76,000.00 50,000.00	50,000.00
26 2924	Variable Frequency Drives - one for Raw Water Pump and one for each High Service Pump	a GE b Cutler-Hammer b Square D	57,000.00	50,000.00 25,000.00	24,000.00


DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATE - EQUALIZATION AND BACKWASH SETTLING TANKS

Two ±20,000 gallon fiberglass tanks and yard piping as detailed on drawing W-2A and specified in 33 1616	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Two ±20,000 gallon bolted steel tanks and yard piping as detailed on Drawing W-2B and specified in 33 1615	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATE - PLANT SCADA Specification Sections 40 9000 through 40 9100

The following I & C system contractor - is offered as an alternative for a deductive lump sum	No Bid	Dexter Fortson (\$100,000.00)	No Bid
Deductive Alternate for the removal of responsibility of supplying plant SCADA system as required in these Specifications	102,000.00	No Bid	103,000.00

I hereby certify that the above is a true and accurate tabulation of bids received at 2:00 p.m. EDST, Thursday, June 5, 2014, at the office of the Floyd County Purchasing Director, located in the Floyd County Administration Building, 12 East Fourth Avenue, Suite 106, Rome, Georgia, for the construction of the Fulton Road Membrane Filtration Facility for Floyd County, Georgia

By  Leon Alison Pierce, P.E., Project Manager
 Georgia License No. 17726
 CTI Engineers, Inc.
 Dalton, Georgia