



OFFICE OF THE COUNTY CLERK

TWELVE EAST 4TH AVENUE, SUITE 209 • POST OFFICE BOX 946 • ROME, GEORGIA 30162
PHONE: 706.291.5110 • FAX: 706.291.5248 • www.romefloyd.com

MEMORANDUM

VIA EMAIL (w/attachments)

To: Nancy Lam, Purchasing Director
From: Jaime Armstrong, Interim County Clerk
Date: September 08, 2015
Subject: Award of bid for Inmate Clothing and Supplies

At their meeting of September 08, 2015, the Board of Commissioners approved the recommendation to award the bid for inmate clothing and supplies by sections as summarized below:

<u>Section</u>	<u>Coverage</u>	<u>Company/Companies (**Split Award)</u>
Section 1	Personal Care Items	Bob Barker
Section 2	Inmate Clothing	** Bob Barker, Uniforms Manufacturing, Georgia Correctional, OD Taragin, Gold Water
Section 3	Bedding and Laundry	** ICS Jail Supplies, Bob Barker, Tabb Textiles

C: Tim Burkhalter, Sheriff's Office (via email w/attachments)
Michael Long, Prison & Work Release Center (via email w/attachments)
Jamie McCord, County Manager (via email w/attachments)
Laura Shores, Finance Administrative Assistant (via email w/attachments)

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
LARRY MAXEY, CHAIRMAN
GARRY FRICKS, VICE-CHAIRMAN
IRWIN BAGWELL
SCOTTY HANCOCK
RHONDA WALLACE

ADMINISTRATION
JAIME ARMSTRONG,
INTERIM COUNTY CLERK



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

TWELVE EAST 4TH AVENUE, SUITE 106 • ROME, GEORGIA 30161
PHONE: 706.291.5118 • FAX: 706.290.6099 • www.rome-floyd.com

To: Jamie McCord, County Manager
From: Nancy Lam, Purchasing Director
Date: September 2, 2015
Subject: Agenda Item - Recommendation of Bid 15-0730 Inmate Clothing and Supplies

Please place on the agenda for the September 8, 2015 BOC meeting for award. This is a one year pricing agreement with optional four one year renewals. Items are ordered on an as needed basis by the Prison, Work Release, and Jail.

Sealed Bids from 18 Companies were received and opened on July 30, 2015. This agreement is for the selected companies to provide Inmate Clothing and Supplies at a fixed price for the first year with an option for 4 annual renewals with the possibility of annual price adjustments.

Bid tabulation is attached with recommended companies to be awarded. The Tabulation has 3 Sections based the category of product and or service provided. A concerted effort was made to minimize the number of companies due to the complexity and diversity of products and to simplify the ordering process. Companies were required to submit samples of product they were bidding. A hands-on evaluation was performed by the Jail and Prison Staff. Some products were not recommended for award based on limited or no projected usage.

Summary of recommended award to split products as follows

<u>SECTION</u>	<u>COVERAGE</u>	<u>RECOMMENDED AWARD</u>
Section 1	Personal Care Items	Bob Barker
Section 2	Inmate Clothing	**Split Award** Bob Barker, Uniforms Manufacturing, Georgia Correctional, OD Taragin, Gold Water
Section 3	Bedding and Laundry	**Split Award** ICS Jail Supplies, Bob Barker, Tabb Textiles

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
LARRY MAXEY, CHAIRMAN
GARRY FRICKS, VICE-CHAIRMAN
IRWIN BAGWELL
RHONDA S. WALLACE
SCOTTY HANCOCK

ADMINISTRATION
NANCY LAM, CPPB, CPPO, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
EVERETT GRAY, CPPB, PURCHASING AGENT



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

TWELVE EAST 4TH AVENUE, SUITE 106 • ROME, GEORGIA 30161
PHONE: 706.291.5118 • FAX: 706.290.6099 • www.romefloyd.com

To: County Manager

Date: 2 September 2015

Subj: Inmate Clothing and Supplies Contract Award Recommendation

Sealed bids were opened and read in public on 30 July 2015 for the Inmate clothing and supplies annual contract. This is a one year contract agreement with the option of four, one year renewals. A complete review of the 18 Suppliers samples were evaluated for quality assurance; safety and security were completed by Purchasing, Prison, Jail and Work Release Center. It is the recommendation of purchasing to accept the bids as indicated below and in the attached spreadsheet.

<u>SECTION</u>	<u>COVERAGE</u>	<u>RECOMMENDED AWARD</u>
Section 1	Personal Care Items	Bob Barker
Section 2	Inmate Clothing	**Split Award** Bob Barker, Uniforms Manufacturing, Georgia Correctional, OD Taragin, Gold Water
Section 3	Bedding and Laundry	**Split Award** ICS Jail Supplies, Bob Barker, Tabb Textiles

Respectfully,
Everett Gray
Purchasing Agent

CC:
Nancy Lam
Prison,
Work Release Center
Jail

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
LARRY MAXEY, CHAIRMAN
GARRY FRICKS, VICE-CHAIRMAN
IRWIN BAGWELL
RHONDA S. WALLACE
SCOTTY HANCOCK

ADMINISTRATION
NANCY LAM, CPPB, CPPO, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
EVERETT GRAY, CPPB, PURCHASING AGENT

FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA
ITEM TOTALS BID TABULATION
Bid 15-0730 - Inmate Clothing and Supplies
 2PM 30 July 2015

ITEM	SECTION 1 - Personal Care Items	TABB TEXTILE CO INC	GOALTEX CORP	CAROLINA TEXTILES	HOLMDEL FOOTWEAR	Goldwater	Keefe Group	ACME SUPPLY	ADVANCED EDUCATIONAL PRODUCTS	AMERCARE PRODUCTS	NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS INC	O.D. TARAGIN + BROS LLC	GEORGIA CORRECTIONAL INDUSTRIES	UNIFORMS MANUFACTURES INC	IN STOCK SUPPLY	BOB BARKER INDUSTRIES	CAMP INDUSTRIES	AMERICAN AMENITIES INC	Remarks
		Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	NO CREDIT CARDS	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	NOT INDICATED	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	Credit Card YES	NO CREDIT CARDS	
1	Razor Twin blades disposable razor equal to Bob Barber's razor. The razor must be in its original packaging and shall be securely attached to razor so no shifting of blades occurs during use.	NO BID	6,926.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	5,293.00	4,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	8,200.00	5,099.52	6,670.00	5,800.00	Bob Barker
2	Shave Cream 0.85 oz. tube, brandless shave cream	NO BID	9,435.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	7,716.75	6,444.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	8,208.00	7,447.50	7,747.50	6,189.20	Bob Barker
3	Toothpaste 3.0 oz. tube, fluoride toothpaste active ingredient sodium monofluorophosphate	NO BID	22,820.63	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	48,000.00	NO BID	19,637.50	12,720.00	23,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	38,216.65	15,371.20	17,020.83	12,516.00	Bob Barker
4	Toothbrush 0.6 oz. tube, fluoride toothpaste active ingredient sodium monofluorophosphate	NO BID	353.33	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	330.00	NO BID	295.92	295.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,104.16	NO BID	370.57	210.40	337.50	NO BID	Bob Barker
5	Toothbrush 0.6 oz. tube, fluoride toothpaste active ingredient sodium monofluorophosphate	NO BID	4,076.59	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	5,000.00	NO BID	3,951.39	3,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	8,056.55	NO BID	4,686.78	3,240.98	5,340.28	5,400.00	Bob Barker
6	Soap 3.0 oz wrapped antibacterial bar/blade handle	NO BID	188.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	180.25	175.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	240.85	127.00	160.75	126.00	Bob Barker
7	Soap 3.0 oz wrapped antibacterial soap	NO BID	3,950.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3,000.00	NO BID	4,133.33	2,240.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	5,178.34	2,484.19	2,991.67	2,006.60	Bob Barker
8	Shampoo Shampoo packets	NO BID	6,182.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	5,800.00	NO BID	5,894.00	4,480.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	8,421.00	4,977.00	5,292.00	4,589.60	Bob Barker
9	Deodorant Single application gel deodorant packets	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	5,600.00	NO BID	4,507.00	4,690.00	NO BID	NO BID	7,700.00	NO BID	6,410.90	5,040.00	4,676.00	3,779.00	Bob Barker
10	Comb 5.5" unbreakable nylon comb	NO BID	517.36	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	600.00	NO BID	468.75	670.00	NO BID	NO BID	805.40	NO BID	465.28	386.10	354.03	376.00	Bob Barker
11	Sanitary Napkin 1" measure proof backing and adhesive strip	NO BID	221.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2,800.00	NO BID	2,351.39	1,972.00	1,960.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2,445.92	1,547.67	6,020.00	1,936.00	Bob Barker

Based on a review of the product samples by the prison and jail and a comparison to one comparable to one supplier for all items in personal care Bob Barker pricing and sales tax for all products in this section

FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA
ITEM TOTALS BID TABULATION
 Bid 15-0730 - Inmate Clothing and Supplies
 2PM 30 July 2015

SECTION 2 - Inmate Clothing

ITEM	ITEM DESCRIPTION	TABB TEXTILE CO INC	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC	GOALTEX CORP	CAROLINA TEXTILES	HOLMDEL FOOTWEAR	Goldwater	Keefe Group	ACME SUPPLY	ADVANCED EDUCATIONAL PRODUCTS	AMERCARE PRODUCTS	NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS INC	O.D. TARAGIN + BROS LLC	GEORGIA CORRECTIONAL INDUSTRIES	UNIFORMS MANUFACTURES	IN STOCK SUPPLY INC	BOB BARKER	CAMP INDUSTRIES	AMERICAN AMENITIES INC	
1	Pant 7 oz. white w/ll fabric with 7 oz. blue w/ll stripes, 1.78" wide double stitched "line" the outside of each leg, (to prohibit removal without destruction of the garment), 34" inseam, 34" front and rear legged, slink style with button fly, beltloops for 34" waist, front and rear pockets bar tacked at stress points. One turn hem (0.32" inseam). Garment shall be machine washable. All seams are to be cleanly finished and have no raw or frayed edges.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4,140.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 13,605.00	\$ 5,808.00	NO BID	\$ 8,074.60	NO BID	NO BID	No Award Recommended No Recommendation due to low bid. Item will be rebid at future date
2	Jump suit Garment shall be of 7.12 oz industrial grade w/ll of 65% polyester and 35% combed cotton with elastic back of 1.12" woven heat resistant elastic. Garment shall have raglan sleeves and lapels to extend to sleeve seam and be bar tacked where the collar, lapel and sleeve meet. All seams are to be cleanly finished and have no raw or frayed edges. One left breast pocket (double stitched and bar tacked) and six snap front (with size 24 lignt snaps). Back shall be stenciled with the following: "FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA" as bar tacked and bar tacked twice. Thread should be same color as fabric and size labels should be color coded by size. All seams are to be cleanly finished and have no raw or frayed edges. Garment shall meet or exceed Federal 14141 Overall 501X.	NO BID	\$ 36,288.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 19,350.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 81,000.00	\$ 20,646.00	NO BID	\$ 20,275.20	NO BID	NO BID	Based on sample submitted
2a	Pre-shrunk jumpsuit with same general description as above. We have noticed some jumpsuits with the same general description as above. We are asking the product they are bidding with respect to weight and materials used and color overall 501X.	NO BID	\$ 36,288.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 20,700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,018.98	NO BID	NO BID	No Award Recommended
3	Underwear White crew style underwear of 65/35 polyester/cotton broadcloth with elastic waistband, patch fly and hemmed legs.	NO BID	\$ 2,702.00	NO BID	\$ 1,598.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,820.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,339.30	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
4	T-shirts White crew neck, long sleeve knit with crew neck and hemmed sleeves and bottoms. Back shall be stenciled (see special instructions). First Quality.	NO BID	\$ 3,688.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9,300.00	\$ 2,580.00	NO BID	\$ 10,929.44	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
5	Uniform Top Orange and navy w/ll, minimum 7 oz 65/35 cotton/polyester blend. Preshrunk and stenciled (see special instructions).	NO BID	\$ 4,505.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 2,245.00	NO BID	\$ 2,408.40	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
6	Uniform Bottom Orange and navy w/ll, minimum 7 oz 65/35 cotton/polyester blend. Preshrunk with double stitched seams.	NO BID	\$ 4,680.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10,625.00	\$ 2,610.00	NO BID	\$ 2,702.16	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
7	Coats Blue denim outer shell of 100% cotton, lining of acrylic blend. Right side breast pocket with button. Back shall be stenciled at stress points. Button front and cuffs. Minimum 16 oz weight. Back shall be stenciled (see special instructions).	NO BID	\$ 5,774.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3,016.00	NO BID	\$ 3,312.88	NO BID	NO BID	Uniforms Manufacturing
8	Sweat shirts Orange blended preshrunk fabric. FIRST QUALITY. Back shall be stenciled (see special instructions).	NO BID	\$ 7,694.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 6,734.00	\$ 5,419.20	NO BID	\$ 3,372.86	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
9	Socks White tube sock 8 1/2 oz polyester/cotton blend. FIRST QUALITY.	NO BID	\$ 520.00	NO BID	\$ 481.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 626.00	\$ 500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 656.00	\$ 390.00	NO BID	\$ 500.00	NO BID	NO BID	Uniforms Manufacturing
10	Hats Regulation Georgia prison cap. Navy trim & Navy band or trim on a natural cap.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Georgia Correctional
11	Tie/Dogtag Blue knit, high bulk acrylic yarn.	NO BID	\$ 458.00	NO BID	\$ 360.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 346.60	\$ 468.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OD Tiegpin
12	Belts Blue military style web belt with gold adjustable buckle.	NO BID	\$ 280.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 292.00	\$ 388.00	NO BID	\$ 298.48	NO BID	NO BID	No Award Recommended
13	Boots 6" black plain toe leather upper with blue soles capable of withstanding 12000 steps.	NO BID	\$ 3,375.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 3,547.50	\$ 2,579.04	NO BID	NO BID	Gold Water
14	Shower Shoes Scurf resistant, non slip, soft sole slip on made of soft pliable vinyl.	NO BID	\$ 7,520.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 7,720.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 12,860.00	\$ 10,920.00	NO BID	\$ 5,560.00	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
15	Foam Clog Navy blue canvas upper with sewn upper. Non-skid, non-marking soles of vulcanized rubber. Machine wash and dry.	NO BID	\$ 4,046.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4,081.00	\$ 4,116.00	NO BID	\$ 2,360.92	NO BID	NO BID	Gold Water
16	Tennis Shoes Navy blue canvas upper with sewn upper. Non-skid, non-marking soles of vulcanized rubber. Machine wash and dry.	NO BID	\$ 14,380.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 13,880.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10,400.00	\$ 8,418.00	NO BID	\$ 297.00	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
17	Thermal Top 65% polyester/35% cotton blended fabric. First quality, waffle-weave thermal knit with knit cuffs. Machine washable and dryable with no shrinkage.	NO BID	\$ 5,725.00	NO BID	\$ 5,646.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 6,800.00	\$ 4,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5,340.00	\$ 3,600.00	NO BID	\$ 3,620.25	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
18	Thermal Bottom 65% polyester/35% cotton blended fabric. First quality, waffle-weave thermal knit. Ankle-length drawers have fly-fronts & elastic waistbands. Machine washable and dryable with no shrinkage.	NO BID	\$ 5,725.00	NO BID	\$ 5,646.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 6,800.00	\$ 4,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5,340.00	\$ 3,315.00	NO BID	\$ 3,138.65	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker

FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA
ITEM TOTALS BID TABULATION
Bid 15-0730 - Inmate Clothing and Supplies
2PM 30 July 2015

SECTION 3 - Bedding and Laundry	
ITEM	PRODUCT DESCRIPTION
1	Wash Minimum 12" x 12" white 3/4 lb per dozen
1A	Wash Minimum 12" x 12" white 1 lb per dozen cotton jersey cloth fabric.
2	Face Towels Minimum 15" x 25" thick white 10 1/2 oz. cotton terry cloth fabric. BEST QUALITY
3	Bath Towels 25" x 50" thick white cotton terry cloth. Style #978 D30 blue stripe. BEST
4	Shirts 66" x 104" flat white minimum 5.0/50
5	Pillow Covers Standard white minimum 50/50
6	Blankets 127" x 251" flame retardant cotton filled
7	Blankets cotton. Shall be pre-shrunk and machine dry cleanable
8	Blankets wool/nylon blend with whip stitched edges. Machine washable and dryable
9	Blankets 30" x 75" x 4" Mattress. 12 oz. clear antimicrobial, flame-resistant vinyl bonded to synthetic scrim at the foot of the mattress. Breathable vent that cannot be picked or ripped apart. 100% Sealed seams lock out unhealthy contaminants
10	Mattress Fire-resistant 16CFR1633 certified. 5" Denimier polyester core compressed to a density of 1.5 lbs per cu ft. Construction to Bob Barker Maximum Security Mattress # SSPM30754CLP
	30" x 75" x 4" cotton core treated with boric acid in enough volume to yield net 10% of the weight of the cotton core. Nylon fabric with bulky fiber coating. Shrinkage 5% max. Colorfast to Cationic Dyes #20255 Blue Softlux 4" thick
11	Kitchen Aprons polyester/nylon with bib and tubular ties
12	Laundry Bags 24" x 36" white non-absorbent, mildew resistant 100% polyester mesh with 100% sewn-on ties and 3" x 6" sewn-on ID tag.
12A	Laundry Bags same as above except with lock
13	Laundry Bags 18" x 24" white non-absorbent, mildew resistant 100% polyester mesh with 100% sewn-on ties and 3" x 6" sewn-on ID tag.
13A	Laundry Bags with Lock same as above except with lock
	Shower Curtain 66" x 72" #5511 Vinyl Shower Curtain Comparable to Calderon Textiles Product # 98-050833875
14	

ITEM	ICM CO INC	GOALTEX CORP	CAROLINA TEXTILES	HOLMDEL FOOTWEAR	Goldwater	Keefe Group	ACME SUPPLY	ADVANCED EDUCATIONAL PRODUCTS	AMERCARE PRODUCTS	NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS INC	O.D. TARAGIN + BROS LLC	GEORGIA CORRECTIONAL INDUSTRIES	UNIFORMS MANUFACTURES	IN STOCK SUPPLY INC	BOB BARKER	CAMP INDUSTRIES	AMERICAN AMENITIES INC	
1	\$ 350.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 588.00	\$ 6,300.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 382.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 368.48	NO BID	NO BID	ICS Jail Supplies
1A	\$ 516.67	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 620.00	\$ 7,700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 386.76	NO BID	NO BID	ICS Jail Supplies
2	\$ 330.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 800.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 348.80	NO BID	NO BID	No Award Recommended
3	\$ 5,133.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 11,872.00	\$ 84,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5,657.34	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
4	\$ 4,350.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5,850.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 7,662.00	NO BID	NO BID	Tabb Textiles
5	\$ 177.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 225.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 190.50	NO BID	NO BID	Tabb Textiles
6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 900.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 994.56	NO BID	NO BID	ICS Jail Supplies
7	\$ 2,250.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8,875.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2,450.00	NO BID	NO BID	Tabb Textiles
8	\$ 4,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4,980.00	NO BID	NO BID	Tabb Textiles
9	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	ICS Jail Supplies
10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 28,242.50	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
11	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 261.28	NO BID	NO BID	No Award Recommended
12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,037.30	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
12A	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 966.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,145.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,061.90	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
13	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 966.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,195.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 675.68	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
13A	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 966.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 885.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 717.50	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 966.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 895.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 717.50	NO BID	NO BID	Bob Barker
14	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	No Award Recommended

Bob Barker low bid did not send sample of Clear Mattress

Discontinue Use

Low Bid did not meet spec for size

Low Bid did not meet spec for size