FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA

Quote Tabulation RFQ 17-0905 Shop Equipment

Due 2pm 5 Sept 2017
Delivery Delivery | Drill & Impact Delivery | AC Recovery Delivery Delivery Ball Joint Delivery
C Shop F Weld Floor Jack Contact
ompany op Fans Days elder Days Driver Days Machine Days oor Jacks Days Service Set Days ontac
Georgia Industrial
Products 620.66 2 4635.42 2 1086.18 ? 3478.26 2 1137.85 2 632.18 2 Alan Garner 770-842-8310
Grainger 1411.36 2 4737.53 5 1180.45 1 4283.32 2 1208.70 2 586.81 2 Andrew Clauson 1 847-753-5362
TNT Fleet Supply 613.64 2 No Bid 1125.11 5 3550.00 2 1085.87 4 698.75 5 Bill Wood 678-898-2860
Orielly Automotive 630.00 15 No Bid 1118.98 10 3525.00 10 790.00 10 560.00 10 Chris George 417-829-5879
Wear Parts and
Equipment No Bid No Bid 1030.53 5 No Bid 1682.09 4 No Bid lan Healy 303-287-1966
Custom Truck &
Equipment 637.40 3 No Bid 1134.29 10 3500.00 3 1113.63 3 582.54 3 Nathan McBurnett 678-685-7031
Midwest Technology
Products 780.52 10 No Bid 1129.25 20 4353.46 20 No Bid 587.98 20 Al Ryan 800-831-5904
Mohawk Rubber sales 640.44 5 No Bid 474.18 Partial 3 3498.00 3 879.42 3 551.24 3 Steve Fulton 678-467-0508
AirGas No Bid 3916.82 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Patrick Hawkins 706-291-1167
Travers Tool Company 1016.08 15 No Bid 1111.96 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid Chastity Grant 800-234-9985
Georgia Air Assoc 3444.00 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Lyle Baker 678-736-5100
National Tool
Warehouse 719.88 7 No Bid 514.99 Partial 7 3329.99 7 1259.97 7 559.99 7 Hans Mack 866-358-1919
Holston Gases 967.58 10 3738.83 10 1063.32 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid Steve Minshew 706-232-6800
Jobbers Equipment
Warehouse 883.92 10 5234.73 10 894.98 7 3599.00 7 1708.98 7 743.99 7 Tamara Ferrel 305-592-8730
Northern Safety &
Industrial 867.30 3 4755.63 14 1106.27 3 3809.52 14 1064.42 14 424.35 14 Andy Baker 770-965-1227
ADF Welding 1347.50 2 3926.45 3 1574.79 10 4991.82 3 1392.6 ? 855.00 2 Joel Tucker 706-512-0845
613.64 3738.83 894.98 3329.99 1085.87 424.35 10087.66




