

No.	ITEM	PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	JAB Trading Industries	Victory Supply	Phoenix Supply	Charm-Tex	ACME Supply	Amercare	Goaltex Corporation	Tab Textile	Bob Barker
1	RAZOR	Twin Blade Disposable Razor: equal to Bob Barker Co. #RTB600, bulk packed. Blades shall be securely attached to razor so no shifting of blades occurs during use.	100,000	\$ 0.100	NO BID	\$ 0.069	\$ 0.060	NO BID	\$ 0.050	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.055
2	SHAVE CREAM	0.85 oz. tube brushless shave cream	36,000	\$ 0.210	NO BID	\$ 0.217	\$ 0.300	NO BID	\$ 0.180	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.250
3	TOOTHPASTE	2.75 oz. tube, fluoride toothpaste, active ingredient sodium monofourphosphate	60,000	\$ 0.350	NO BID	\$ 0.275	\$ 0.270	NO BID	\$ 0.220	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.250
4	TOOTHBRUSH	Unbreakable, short handle (approx. 3"), 25 Tuft	100,000	\$ 0.040	NO BID	\$ 0.034	\$ 0.032	NO BID	\$ 0.040	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.035
5	SOAP	0.5 oz. unwrapped bar, bulk packed	22,000	\$ 0.060	NO BID	\$ 0.017	\$ 0.029	NO BID	\$ 0.035	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.035
6	SOAP	3 oz. wrapped anti-bacterial soap	12,000	\$ 0.280	NO BID	\$ 0.242	\$ 0.206	NO BID	\$ 0.250	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.200
7	SOAP	soap all-in-1 dissolvable pak	500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.174	NO BID	\$ 0.350	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.190
8	SOAP	All in One Shave, Shower, Shampoo	29,000	\$ 0.320	NO BID	\$ 0.045	\$ 0.037	NO BID	\$ 0.038	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.050
9	SHAMPOO	Single application conditioning shampoo packets	140,000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.039	\$ 0.037	NO BID	\$ 0.036	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.030
10	SHAMPOO	Shampoo, Lice Control 1 gal.	150	\$ 49.000	NO BID	\$ 53.650	\$ 36.900	NO BID	\$ 29.500	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 44.000
11	DEODORANT	Single application gel deodorant 0.12 oz. packets	170,000	\$ 0.040	NO BID	\$ 0.031	\$ 0.035	NO BID	\$ 0.035	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.036
12	COMB	5" unbreakable nylon comb	30,000	\$ 0.040	NO BID	\$ 0.015	\$ 0.019	NO BID	\$ 0.015	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.0175
13	SANITARY NAPKIN	Individually wrapped 7 1/2" long, thick core maxi pad with moisture proof backing and adhesive	52,000	\$ 0.100	NO BID	\$ 0.085	\$ 0.050	NO BID	\$ 0.045	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.045
14	CLIPPERS	Fingernail/Toenail, metal, no file	50	\$ 0.630	NO BID	\$ 0.323	\$ 0.680	NO BID	\$ 0.790	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.400
		Toenail	\$	\$	\$	\$	\$	\$	\$	\$	\$	\$ 0.500
TOTAL SECTION I				\$ 77,101.500	NO BID	\$ 63,108.590	\$ 60,339.000	NO BID	\$ 51,971.500	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 57,520.000
				(12)	0	(13)	(14)	(0)	(14)	(0)	(0)	(14)

No.	ITEM	PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE
15	PANT	7 oz. white twill fabric with 7 oz. blue twill stripe, 1 7/8" wide double stitched "into" the outside of each leg, (to prohibit removal without destruction of the garment). Garment should be straight legged, slack style with button fly, belt loops for 3/4" belt, front and rear pockets bar tacked at stress points. One turn hem to 32" inseam. Garment shall be preshrunk, colorfast and machine washable. All seams are to be cleanly finished and have no raw or frayed edges. Available in SIZES 32 through 60.	60 Doz.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 69.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

16	JUMPSUIT	Garment shall be of 7 1/2 oz. industrial grade twill of 65% polyester and 35% combed cotton with elastic back of 1 1/2" woven heat resistant elastic. Garment shall come in assorted colors, including orange, white, navy and green. Garment should have raglan sleeves and labels to extend to sleeve seam and be bar tacked where the collar, lapel and sleeve meet. All seams, including waist seam, shall be triple needle stitched. Front shall have one left breast pocket (double stitched and bar tacked) and six snap front (with size 24 ligne snaps). Back shall be stenciled (see special instructions). Crotch should be triple stitched and bar tacked twice. Thread should be same color as fabric and size labels should be color coded by size. All seams are to be cleanly finished and have no raw or frayed edges. Garment shall meet or exceed Robinson Textile Coverall 501X. Available in SIZES Medium through 9XLarge.	1,800	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 14.000	\$ 14.900	\$ 10.250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 11.900
17	PRE-SHRUNK JUMPSUIT	Floyd County is asking vendors to provide a Pre-Shrunk Jumpsuit with same general description as above. It has been noticed some jumpsuits shrink up to 2 sizes. Vendors are asked to provide the details of the product they are bidding with respect to weight and materials used and color choices. Available in SIZES Medium through 9XLarge.	Qty. will be same as above if available	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10.250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
18	UNDERWEAR	White boxer style underwear of 65/35 polyester/cotton bread-cloth with elastic waistband, patch fly and hemmed legs. Available in SIZES 30 to 52 or up to 5XL	140 Doz.	\$ 10.500	\$ 9.640	\$ 12.000	\$ 13.900	\$ 12.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10.200
19	T-SHIRTS	White 50/50 jersey knit with crew neck and hemmed sleeves and bottoms. Back shall be stenciled (see special instructions). Available in SIZES Large through 6XLarge.	100 Doz.	NO BID	\$ 26.870	\$ 40.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 19.200
20	UNIFORM TOP	Orange and Navy twill, minimum 7 oz. 65/35 cotton/polyester blend. Pre-shrunk with double stitched seams. Back shall be stenciled (see special instructions) Available in SIZES Small through 6XLarge.	500	\$ 5.020	\$ 5.130	\$ 7.000	\$ 6.540	\$ 5.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.250

21	UNIFORM BOTTOMS	Orange and Navy twill, minimum 7 oz. 65/35 cotton/polyester blend. Pre-shrunk with double stitched seams. Available in SIZES Small through 6XLarge.	500	\$ 5.050	\$ 5.390	\$ 7.000	\$ 6.900	\$ 6.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 6.000
22	COATS	Blue denim outer shell of 100% cotton, lining of acrylic blend. Right side breast pocket double stitched and bar tacked at stress points. Button front and cuffs. Minimum 10 oz. weight. Back shall be stenciled (see special instructions). Available in SIZES Small through 6XLarge.	200	NO BID	\$ 16.210	NO BID	\$ 16.720	\$ 15.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.000
23	SWEATSHIRTS	Orange blended pre-shrunk fabric, first quality. Back shall be stenciled (see special instructions). Available in SIZES Large through 6XLarge.	40 Doz.	NO BID	\$ 82.440	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 72.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.000
24	SOCKS	White tube style 80/20 polyester/cotton blend. Pre-Shrunk, first quality. ONE SIZE FITS ALL.	100 Doz.	\$ 4.250	\$ 3.880	\$ 5.600	\$ 5.180	\$ 4.950	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.000
25	BOONIE HAT	100% polyester, florescent orange, silver reflective tape. Similar to LTS Tools Inc. #1271-0. Available in SIZES Large through Xlarge.	200	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
26	TOBOGGANS	Orange Knit, High bulk acrylic yarn. ONE SIZE FITS ALL.	200	NO BID	\$ 0.990	NO BID	\$ 0.960	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.095
27	BELTS	Blue military style belt webbing. 1 1/4" width. Poly/cotton webbing.	2 ROLLS	NO BID	\$ 39.880	NO BID	\$ 64.900	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.000
28	BOOTS	6" Black, plain toe, leather upper with durable soles capable of withstanding high temperature. Available in SIZES 6 through 15	150	NO BID	\$ 13.110	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 24.950	NO BID	\$ 19.000
29	SHOWER SHOES	Scuff resistant, non slip, soft sole slip. Autoclavable for sanitary concerns. Made of soft pliable vinyl or PVC. Available in SIZES 5 through 15.	4,000	\$ 1.600	\$ 1.370	\$ 2.750	\$ 1.800	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1.790	NO BID	\$ 1.400
30	FOAM CLOG	Foam clog with heel strap similar in style, quality and design of the Bob Barker EV-OR. Available in SIZES 5 through 15.	700	\$ 2.000	\$ 3.740	NO BID	\$ 3.720	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 45.000
31	TENNIS SHOES	Navy blue canvas upper with sewn upper. Non-skid, non-marking soles of vulcanized rubber. Machine wash and dry. Available in SIZES 7 through 15.	2000	\$ 3.400	\$ 2.860	\$ 4.500	\$ 4.180	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.970	NO BID	\$ 2.800
32	THERMAL TOP	65% Polyester/ 35% cotton blended fabric, first quality, waffle weave thermal knit with knit cuffs. Machine washable and dryable with no shrinkages. Available in SIZES Medium to 6XLarge.	1500	NO BID	\$ 2.240	\$ 3.500	NO BID	\$ 3.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.500

33	THERMAL BOTTOM	65% Polyester/ 35% cotton blended fabric, first quality, waffle weave thermal knit. Ankle-length drawers have fly-fronts and elastic waistbands. Machine washable and dryable with no shrinkage. Available in SIZES Medium to 6XLarge.	1500	NO BID	\$ 2.180	\$ 3.500	NO BID	\$ 3.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1.800	
TOTAL SECTION II					\$ 21,530.000	\$ 38,924.460	\$ 68,940.000	\$ 31,013.800	\$ 63,595.000	NO BID	\$ 16,842.500	NO BID	\$ 60,716.000
					(6)	(15)	(10)	(11)	(11)	(0)	(3)	(0)	(16)

No.	ITEM	PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE
34	WASHCLOTH	Minimum 12" X 12" white 3/4 lbs. per dozen cotton terry cloth fabric	2,800	\$ 0.200	\$ 0.140	\$ 0.190	\$ 0.158	\$ 0.125	NO BID	\$ 0.183	\$ 0.120	\$ 0.130
35	WASHCLOTH	Minimum 12" X 12" white 1 lb. per dozen cotton terry cloth fabric.	2,800	\$ 0.200	\$ 0.180	\$ 0.210	\$ 0.196	\$ 0.163	NO BID	\$ 0.233	\$ 0.190	\$ 0.220
36	FACE TOWELS	Minimum 15" X 25" thick white 10 1/2 oz. cotton terry cloth fabric. First Quality	800	NO BID	\$ 0.570	\$ 0.500	NO BID	\$ 0.500	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.390	\$ 0.750
37	BATH TOWELS	25" x 50" thick white cotton terry cloth. Shall meet or exceed the quality of Dundee styles P9078 D30 blue strips. First quality.	2,800	NO BID	\$ 1.890	\$ 1.810	NO BID	\$ 3.750	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1.200	\$ 2.050
38	BATH TOWELS	20" X 40" Thick white cotton terry cloth. Dense-looped 100% cotton. First quality	2,800	\$ 0.730	\$ 0.820	\$ 0.990	\$ 0.900	\$ 0.666	NO BID	\$ 0.961	\$ 0.530	\$ 1.500
39	SHEETS	66" X 104" Flat white, minimum 50/50 Polyester/Cotton blend, no iron muslin.	1,800	\$ 2.690	\$ 2.190	\$ 3.200	\$ 2.990	\$ 2.666	NO BID	\$ 4.869	\$ 2.080	\$ 2.900
40	PILLOW CASES	Standard white minimum 50/50 polyester/cotton blend, no iron muslin.	300	\$ 0.540	\$ 0.950	\$ 0.750	\$ 0.640	\$ 0.666	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.600	\$ 0.700
41	PILLOWS	17" x 25" Flame-retardant, cotton filled. Meets NFPA 701 flammability requirements.	200	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.500	\$ 9.900	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 6.500
42	PILLOWS	17" x 25" Flame-retardant, 100% polyester fiber core filled. Meets NFPA 701 flammability requirements.	200	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.500	\$ 5.180	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4.750
43	BLANKETS	White non-allergenic, non-static 100% cotton. Shall be pre-shrunk and machine washable and dryable.	500	\$ 6.500	\$ 4.240	\$ 6.800	\$ 6.540	\$ 6.000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4.500	\$ 4.950
44	BLANKETS	Gray, flame-retardant minimum 70/30 wool/nylon blend with whip stitched edges. Machine washable and dryable with no shrinkage.	1,000	NO BID	\$ 5.440	\$ 5.750	\$ 5.260	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 4.150	\$ 6.500

45	MATTRESS	30" X 75" X 4" Mattress, 12 oz. clear, antimicrobial, flame-retardant vinyl blended to synthetic scrim at the foot of the mattress. Concealed, breathable vent that cannot be picked or ripped apart. 100% sealed seams lock out unhealthy contaminants. Fire-retardant 16CFR1633 certified, 5" densified polyester core compressed to a 4" finished height. Comparable in construction to Bob Barker Maximum Security Mattress #SSPM30754CLP.	100	NO BID	\$ 73.810	NO BID	\$ 51.900	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 53.000
46	MATTRESS	30" X 75" X 4" cotton core treated with boric acid in enough volume to yield net 10% of the weight of the cotton core. Nylon fabric with butyl rubber coating. Shall meet or exceed Georgia Correctional Industries #20255 Blue Soflux 4" thick mattress.	750	NO BID	\$ 84.660	NO BID	\$ 69.900	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 54.000
47	MATTRESS	30" X 75" X 4" Densified Polyester Core. Clear vinyl covering minimum of 10 oz. and 16 mil. Must meet NFPA 701,16 CFR Part 1632 (FF4-72), Classified Class A, passes vertical flame test if Federal Standard 191, Method 5903.	750	NO BID	\$ 68.110	NO BID	\$ 51.900	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 54.000
48	MATTRESS	30" X 75" X 6" Densified Polyester Core. Clear vinyl covering minimum of 10 oz. and 16 mil. Must meet NFPA 701,16 CFR Part 1632 (FF4-72), Classified Class A, passes vertical flame test if Federal Standard 191, Method 5903.	750	NO BID	\$ 69.140	NO BID	\$ 54.900	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
49	LAUNDRY BAGS	18" X 24" White non-absorbent, mildew resistant 100% polyester mesh with 100% sewn-on tie cord and 3" X 6" sewn-on ID tag.	500	NO BID	\$ 1.950	\$ 2.250	\$ 2.070	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1.460
50	LAUNDRY BAGS	18" X 24" White non-absorbent, mildew resistant 100% polyester mesh with 100% sewn-on tie cord and 3" X 6" sewn-on ID tag with lock.	500	\$ 2.500	\$ 2.080	\$ 2.670	\$ 2.070	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1.460
51	LAUNDRY BAGS	24" X 36" White non-absorbent, mildew resistant 100% polyester mesh with 100% sewn-on tie cord and 3" X 6" sewn-on ID tag.	500	NO BID	\$ 2.390	\$ 2.700	\$ 2.490	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.250
52	LAUNDRY BAGS	24" X 36" White non-absorbent, mildew resistant 100% polyester mesh with 100% sewn-on tie cord and 3" X 6" sewn-on ID tag with lock.	500	\$ 3.200	\$ 2.560	\$ 3.000	\$ 2.490	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.250

53	LAUNDRY BAGS	24" X 36" Assorted Colors: Green and White non-absorbent, mildew resistant 100% polyester mesh with 100% sewn-on tie cord and 3" X 6" sewn-on ID tag.	200	NO BID	\$ 3.030	\$ 3.650	\$ 4.180	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.250	
54	KITCHEN APRONS	34" X 36" White 7 1/4 oz. 50/50 polyester/nylon with bib and tubular ties.	200	NO BID	\$ 1.750	NO BID	\$ 1.790	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1.550	
55	SHOWER CURTAIN	36" 77" Heavy Duty Vinyl Shower Curtain with Velcro jiffy tabs, flame-retardant. Similar to Bob Barker #SCV3677	220	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18.000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.000	
TOTAL SECTION III					\$ 14,268.000 (8)	\$ 199,986.500 (19)	\$ 32,735.000 (16)	\$ 164,100.200 (19)	\$ 229,820.000 (9)	NO BID (0)	\$ 12,622.340 (4)	\$ 16,348.000 (9)	\$ 122,685.000 (21)

GRAND TOTALS:		\$ 112,899.500	\$ 238,910.960	\$ 164,783.590	\$ 255,453.000	\$ 293,415.000	\$ 51,971.500	\$ 29,464.840	\$ 16,348.000	\$ 240,921.000
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS OFFERED		(26)	(34)	(39)	(44)	(20)	(14)	(7)	(9)	(51)